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Married At First Sight Chapter 3106-When Kathryn ate out, she packed it in 
case she couldn’t finish it. She was not afraid of others laughing at her. 

She grew up in a rural area, and her life at her adoptive mother’s house was 
not good. She was reluctant to waste things, which seemed normal to others. 

Ten minutes later,. 

Kathryn drove her car back to Farrell’s Group. Several people stopped her as 
soon as she returned to the company gate. 

Those people were part of her adoptive mother’s family. 

They must have been waiting in the Farrell Group for a long time, but they 
didn’t wait for her to come out. Unexpectedly, she went out. 

After the adoptive brother turned around and saw that the person in the car 
was Kathryn, he told his adoptive mother. The adoptive mother turned to look 
at Kathryn. After making sure that she was right, she came over with her two 
sons. 

Kathryn slowly stopped the car. 

She was not afraid of these three people in her territory. 

She believed they would not dare touch her on Farrell’s territory. 

When they got closer, Kathryn pressed down the car window and asked her 
adoptive mother coldly, “What are you three doing here?” 

“Kathryn.” 

The adoptive mother forced out a smile. In Kathryn’s eyes, her smile was 
uglier than crying. 

Her biological daughter died last night. If she said she wasn’t sad, that would 
be a lie. 



Kathryn said calmly, “If you don’t want to laugh, don’t laugh. Your daughter 
died just last night. You shouldn’t laugh now. Although she didn’t grow up 
beside you, you always knew that she was your daughter. Every time your 
husband comes home, you will give him the best things in the house to give to 
your daughter. 

It’s a lie to say you don’t have feelings. Now that she’s dead, it’s normal for 
you, as a mother, to feel uncomfortable. Don’t force yourself to laugh.” 

The adoptive mother looked haggard, as if she had aged ten years, and her 
eyes were red and swollen. 

In Kathryn’s words, how could she not be sad when her biological daughter 
died? 

“Kathryn…” The adoptive mother wiped the tears from her eyes and choked 
with sobs. “Kathryn, we just want to come and see you.” 

“I’m sorry for you in the past.” Kathryn still looked indifferent and said, “The 
past is in the past. I don’t want to mention it. You are sorry for me. Seeing as 
you didn’t strangle me to death when I was a child and let me grow up, I don’t 
want to mention it either. You care too much.” 

“After seeing it, go back and live your life. I’m fine!” 

She had integrated into the Farrell family’s life. 

She was becoming more and more stable in her position as the young 
mistress of the Farrell family. 

They didn’t need to worry. 

They wouldn’t worry about her, either. What they worried about before was 
that she would be able to gain a foothold and be detrimental to their biological 
daughter. 

No matter how badly Shiloh treated them, they were still their children, and the 
adoptive mother’s heart was always biased towards Shiloh. 

In fact, Kathryn, who had just found out that she was the biological daughter 
of the Farrell family, was envious of Shiloh after returning to the Farrell family. 



At that time, Shiloh was favored by both her biological parents and her 
adoptive parents and brothers in the Farrell family. 

Kathryn was a real relative, but they didn’t love her as a foster relative. 

“Kathryn, no matter what, my parents have raised you, but now the family is 
having a hard time, and Shiloh, can you give us some money?” 

 


