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I am a quadrillionarire chapter 2693-“Hahaha!” 

Diablo laughed for several minutes before stopping. 

He was so ecstatic. 

Everything that happened today went according to his plan. 

He brought the six top forces of the Boundless Galaxy to besiege the Divine 
Snow Mountain, deliberately hiding his strength, making Madam Nubia see 
the hope of winning and taking out the Divine Ax of the Divine Snow 
Mountain, and then exposing his strength and snatching the Divine Ax as his 
own. 

Everything was exactly what Diablo had in mind. 

Now that things had developed to this point, it was almost at the end. 

All that was left was to catch all the people in the Divine Snow Mountain, kill 
them all, and completely destroy the Divine Snow Mountain. 

Diablo would not give them a chance to make a comeback. 

After all, the Divine Snow Mountain had controlled and studied the Divine Ax 
for so many years. Who knew if they still had the means to control it? 

“Madam Nubia, you and your sect shouldn’t blame me for uprooting you. This 
is the rule. If you want to blame 

someone, blame it on your lack of strength and your inability to exert the full 
power of the Divine Ax. That’s how you let me take advantage of you,” Diablo 
looked at Madam Nubia and said. 

Madam Nubia remained silent. 

She had known for a long time that once she lost, it would inevitably end like 
this. 

There was no way Diablo would spare the Divine Snow Mountain. 



A sad atmosphere spread to the entire top of the Divine Snow Mountain. 

The former leader of Boundless Galaxy was about to come to an end. 

Except for Diablo’s force, the other five top forces began to regret this. 

They did not know if they made the right choice. 

Would they be able to live in peace once Diablo took over the Boundless 
Galaxy? 

Probably not! 

From the moment Diablo said that those who followed him would prosper and 
those who went against him would perish, everyone knew that things were not 
as simple as imagined. 

He would also not fulfill his promise. 

However, since things had reached this point, there was no point in regretting 
this. 

Diablo’s goal had been achieved, so he did not want to waste time anymore. 
He had to go back and study the Divine Ax! 

So, he concentrated his power on the Divine Ax. 

A suffocating aura emanated from the Divine Ax and it was becoming stronger 
and stronger. 

The bloody light also became more and more abundant. 

When the ax fell, the Divine Snow Mountain would also become history. 

All the disciples of the Divine Snow Mountain on the top of the mountain 
showed no resistance at all, including Madam Nubia. They were all silently 
waiting for death to come. 

Because they know that everything they did would be in vain while facing the 
Divine Ax used by Diablo, a Sovereign Ranker. 

However, there were exceptions. 



At the back of the Divine Snow Mountain’s troop, two people were busy 
preparing something. 

“Master, please hurry up! Diablo is about to take action. 

Once the ax strikes down, we will all die. No one can escape!” Lucia urged 
anxiously. 

“Don’t panic, don’t panic! I’m looking for it! I’ll find it soon,” Reva replied. 

She asked Lucia not to panic, but in fact, she was also panicking in her heart. 

One could tell by her trembling hands. 

It was a matter of life and death for her and all the disciples of the Divine 
Snow Mountain, so it would be strange if Reva was not panicking. 

Although she had seriously doubted the usefulness of the small wooden box, 
she had no choice now but to take it out and give it a try. 

“Master, you didn’t throw it away, did you?” Lucia could not help but wonder. 

“Of course, not! Even if I don’t think it is of any use, I will never throw it away. 
Don’t worry! It’s just that I have a lot of things and I haven’t found it yet.” 

“Hurry up!” 

“Almost!” 

Diablo had already taken action during the conversation between the master 
and disciple. 


