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I am a quadrillionarire chapter 2307-Iridescent Sect, Iridescent Continent, Star 
Kingdom. 

Nova was busy dealing with the sundries of the sect when suddenly, a crack 
appeared in the space above the Iridescent Sect. 

Then, seven figures—Blue and the others who were rushing over from the 
Central Sacred Continent—emerged from the crack. 

“Sid, are you sure this is the place?” Blue asked, looking at the cluster of 
buildings below. 

“Mr. David told me he would be in seclusion in Iridescent Sect, and that I 
could look for him whenever I needed, but I’ve never had the need to confirm 
if he was truly here,” Sid replied honestly. 

“I’ll make it clear now, Sid. If David is here, then I’ll let you off. If he isn’t, I 
won’t be blamed for the cruelty that’ll come next. You will know how it feels to 
beg for death and I will destroy Star Kingdom before your eyes. You will watch 
as this homeland you’ve worked so hard to protect, disintegrate into nothing 
along with its countless lives,” Blue sneered. 

Sid did not say a word, not when he could not confirm if David was truly 
present. 

He never needed to search for the man himself, after all. 

Yet, with things the way they were now, Sid had no choice but to trust that 
David told him the truth, or countless lives in the Star Kingdom would have to 
succumb to Blue’s merciless massacre. 

No one could withstand the fury of a Deity and the Star Kingdom would only 
be turned to ruins. 

Blue and the others did not try to conceal their arrival at Iridescent Sect’s 
airspace, so it took no time before Iridescent Sect’s defense array picked 
them up. 

Nova immediately put down her work and notified all the seniors of the sect. 



Soon, many sect disciples and seniors arrived and surrounded Blue and the 
others. 

Blue ignored them and began his search for David using his mind power. 

A partial deity had no chance of hiding from him. 

Seeing as their master said nothing, everyone else remained silent as well-
Vaughn’s death was a good example of what happened to those who spoke 
out of line. 

As the head of the TSA, Sid was an influential man in Star Kingdom. His 
efforts in protecting the Kingdom had garnered great reverence from the 
people of the Kingdom and even ordinary disciples of the Iridescent Sect 
recognized him with ease. 

Seeing that Sid was part of the group of intruders, everyone relaxed as they 
had the utmost trust in this man. 

Sid had only gotten to where he was today because of the efforts he had put 
in to protect the Star Kingdom. 

Even with the news of David saving the Star Kingdom spreading far and wide, 
his popularity was far from that of Sid’s. 

When Nova arrived, her eyes immediately landed on Sid and the four other 
Sacred Saints. 

Five of Star Kingdom’s six Sacred Saints were here, but she did not know 
why. 

Nova did not recognize the other two, as she was not born yet when Sahar 
was active, then Nek took over to lead the Simmons. 

As the sect leader of the Iridescent Sect, Nova only knew of a Grandmaster 
Sahar, but she had never seen the man before. 

“Lord Sid, how could I help you? You didn’t have to come all the way here if 
there’s something you needed me to do, a message would have sufficed,” 
Nova put her hands together and asked courteously. 

Even David treated this selfless man with respect, so how could anyone else 
not? 



Sid did not dare to say a word, deterred by Vaughn’s death. 

Beside him, Blue frowned as he could not detect David’s presence at all. 

 


