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Chapter 1533 Your True Enemy 
Meanwhile, Fernando left right after sending Kai to the Department of Justice. It seemed 
like Fernando wasn’t keen on meeting Arthur. 
Kai entered the Department of Justice and bumped into Theodore. It had been a long 
time since they met each other in person. 

“Mr. Chance!” Theodore was rather excited to see Kai appearing in the Department of 
Justice. 

“It’s been a while, General Jackson.” Kai smiled. 

“It really has. I heard that the Warriors Alliance has been causing you trouble non-stop, 
even sending people out to hunt you down several times. Why are you still in 
Jadeborough?” Theodore asked in confusion. 

Although Theodore heard about Kai all the time, he didn’t know much about what was 
going on behind the scene. 

In fact, there were a lot of things that he, the general of the Department of Justice, 
couldn’t intervene in. 

Besides, with Arthur leading the Department of Justice, Xavier would be the one 
attending to matters regarding Kai. Hence, Theodore couldn’t do anything to help him. 

“I came to look for Mr. Sanders,” Kai said. 

“Oh, I see. Mr. Sanders is waiting for you in the main hall. I’ll bring you there.” 

With that, Theodore led Kai toward the main hall. 

Kai was frowning because he was baffled. What? Mr. Sanders is waiting for me? How 
did he know I was coming? 

Upon arriving in the main hall, Theodore excused himself tactfully. 

Arthur was sitting at the head of the table and sipping his coffee while Xavier was 
standing nearby. 

Seeing that Kai had arrived, Arthur uttered, “Have a seat.” 

Kai took a seat without hesitation. Before he could utter a word, Arthur said, “If you’ve 
come here to ask for help, save it. I’m not going to step in and rescue your mother and 
your girlfriend. You ought to rely upon yourself if you wish to save them. If you aren’t 
capable of protecting them, perhaps having them locked up is the wiser option.” 



Kai was flabbergasted. I haven’t even said anything yet. How did Mr. Sanders know 
what was on my mind? 

Indeed, Kai was there to ask Arthur if the latter could get the Warriors Alliance to set his 
girlfriend free and also convince the Deragon family to let his mother go. 

However, Kai was feeling a little awkward now because Arthur had rejected him even 
before he could say anything. 

“Mr. Sanders, since you’re not going to help me, could you please tell me how strong 
the Warriors Alliance is exactly? What should I do to beat them and rescue my 
girlfriend?” Kai had just realized that he knew too little about the Warriors Alliance. After 
so many confrontations, I understand that I’ve been underestimating them. The men 
they deployed were all nothing but powerful. 

Arthur kept silent and suddenly looked out the window. At that moment, his gaze looked 
inexplicably lost. 

Kai felt a sense of despair wash over him when he saw Arthur’s expression. 

Prior to that, Arthur had always appeared calm and unfathomable. 

At that precise moment, however, it was as if Kai could tell what was on Arthur’s mind. 
Mr. Sanders looks helpless too. 

After a long while, Arthur regained his composure and took a sip of his coffee. “You 
shouldn’t only focus on the Warriors Alliance. Your true enemy is way scarier than 
them…” 

With that, Arthur stood up and left the main hall. Meanwhile, Kai was left perplexed as 
he watched Arthur leave. 

Kai had no idea what Arthur meant. Why is my true enemy scarier than the Warriors 
Alliance? Who’s my true enemy? 

While Kai was still in a daze, Xavier walked up to him and took out a charm. The 
writings on the charm were written with a cinnabar rosary. However, Kai had no idea 
what they meant. 
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Although Kai was slightly skilled in the technique of charm, he couldn’t understand a 
thing when he saw that charm. 



“This is from Mr. Sanders. It’ll save your life during a crucial moment.” Xavier handed 
that piece of charm to Kai. 

“A life-saving charm? Is this thing that amazing?” Kai examined the charm after 
receiving it. 

“Mr. Sanders said you must bring this charm with you today because you’ll face fatal 
danger today.” 

With that, Xavier turned around and left, leaving Kai alone inside the spacious lobby. 

After keeping the charm, Kai strode out of the Department of Justice. 

At that moment, Theodore was already waiting for Kai at the entrance with a car, and he 
would be personally chauffeuring the latter. 

Theodore rolled down the car window and said, “Get in the car, Mr. Chance. I’ll send 
you out of the city. I believe no one will dare to mess with the Department of Justice.” 

Kai didn’t refuse the offer and immediately got into the vehicle. Then, the car sped off 
toward the outside of the city. 

Right after Kai and the others left the Department of Justice, Zion received the news at 
once. 

“Hmph! I must have Kai’s head brought to me today.” Zion snorted. 

Gilbert, standing beside Zion, remained silent. With a tiger head sword strapped on his 
back, he spun on his heel, got into a car, and departed. 

Meanwhile, in the Jadeborough suburb, Theodore halted the car before ordering his 
men to survey the surroundings. Only then did he speak to Kai. “Mr. Chance, you may 
get out of the vehicle now. There’s no one around.” 

Kai nodded and exited the vehicle. 

However, he knitted his brows the next second as a grimace spread across his face. 

Taking in his facial expression, Theodore hastily asked, “What’s the matter, Mr. 
Chance? I already instructed my subordinates to scout around this area.” 

“General Jackson, all of you must leave as fast as you can. Do not linger here any 
longer.” 

With that, Kai lifted his head a little and shifted his gaze onto a nearby mountain peak. 



Theodore swiftly looked in the same direction and noticed someone standing on the 
mountaintop. 

Soon, that person jumped, leaping directly off the top of the mountain. 

His body glided in mid-air like a bird for some distance before finally landing steadily in 
front of Kai and the others. 

Although that person was putting forth his best effort to hold back his aura, Kai could 
still sense his overwhelming presence. 

The frown on Kai’s face deepened as his countenance turned a few shades darker. 

When Theodore saw that person before them, his expression changed drastically, and 
he stumbled a few steps backward uncontrollably. 

“G-Gilbert Feigenbaum!” Theodore started to hyperventilate as colors drained from his 
face. 

The other members of the Department of Justice also backed away one after the other 
as if they had come face-to-face with a demon. 

Witnessing their facial expressions, Kai instantly understood that the man in front of him 
was very dangerous and terrifying. Otherwise, a General of the Department of Justice 
like Theodore wouldn’t have reacted that way. 

“General Jackson, who is this man?” Kai asked softly. 

“Mr. Chance, this man is called Gilbert Feigenbaum. He was the most notorious 
Demonic Cultivator in the martial arts world twenty years ago, but he should have died 
twenty years ago. How is he showing up here all of a sudden?” Theodore uttered with a 
trembling voice. 

He was already an infamous Demonic Cultivator twenty years ago? In that case, this 
man’s capabilities must be honed beyond measure now. 

Gilbert pointed at Kai and uttered coldly, “This man named Kai will have to stay. The 
others can get lost at once. I’m in a good mood today, so I don’t feel like murdering 
additional people.” 

Kai told Theodore, “General Jackson, you all should leave now instead of remaining 
here and adding to unnecessary casualties.” 

“Mr. Chance, you need to be extra careful. Gilbert was already a Martial Arts Marquis 
twenty years ago. It is very likely that he has broken through to the next level and is now 
a Greater Martial Arts Marquis,” Theodore reminded Kai. 
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Kai nodded. Then, Theodore left with his men. He knew their presence wouldn’t be 
significant since Gilbert could end their lives with a wave of his hand. 

Theodore wanted to return as quickly as possible to report that incident to Arthur. The 
Demonic Cultivator, Gilbert, is still alive. This is a piece of important news. 

Following Theodore’s departure, Gilbert didn’t hasten to make a move. Instead, he 
crossed his hands behind his back and bored his piercing gaze into Kai, seemingly 
intending to see through the latter. 

“You are equipped with such outstanding capabilities at such a young age. You must 
either be blessed with great opportunities or have a unique background. Perhaps I can 
figure out a way to achieve a breakthrough in my cultivation from you today.” 

Gilbert smiled menacingly as if he had already regarded Kai as his prey. 

“Why do you want to kill me? Did someone instruct you, or is there any other reason?” 

Kai was baffled. I’m not acquainted with this Gilbert, nor are there any grudges between 
us, so why does he want to murder me? 

“The reason is not important because what’s significant is your imminent death. Tell me 
your secret and hand over all your magical items. Perhaps I can grant you a swift death 
then.” Gilbert looked at Kai mockingly. 

Kai narrowed his eyes. “Why are you so sure you’re able to kill me?” 

At that moment, he was reminded of the charm given to him by Arthur, as well as the 
latter’s reminder. Mr. Sanders said I’ll be facing fatal danger today. It seems like his 
prediction is on point, and the charm will be able to save my life after all! 

“What’s the matter? Are you expecting any helpers?” Gilbert glanced around. 

“No. No help is coming. Still, you won’t be able to kill me even if I’m alone,” Kai sneered. 

“Oh?” Gilbert arched his brow in amusement. “Why don’t you enlighten me on why 
you’re so confident I can’t kill you?” 

“No reason. If you don’t believe me, please feel free to try.” 

Kai was trying to provoke Gilbert. 



If that charm worked, he could seize that opportunity to escape. 

When facing a Top Level Martial Arts Marquis like Gilbert, Kai couldn’t think of any way 
to survive except for fleeing for his life. 

“Are you attempting to anger me? It seems like you’re very impatient for me to attack 
you. Are you, by any chance, carrying something that can save your life?” Gilbert looked 
at Kai with a contemptuous smile as if he had read Kai’s mind. 

Kai knitted his brows and started to panic. He didn’t expect Gilbert to be so smart and 
was able to figure out his plan. 

“Hmph! If you don’t dare to make a move, I will.” 

Golden lights enveloped Kai’s body as he exuded a terrifying aura the next instant. 

Meanwhile, Gilbert merely stared at him calmly, seemingly unfazed by the level of 
capabilities exhibited by Kai. 

“Let me find out how strong a Demonic Cultivator from twenty years ago can be!” Kai 
bellowed and swung his fist at Gilbert. 

His clenched hand was covered in golden light, radiating the frightening and 
continuously intensifying Power of Dragons. 

Gilbert curled his lips into a mocking smile before casually lifting his hand to intercept 
Kai’s strike. 

Boom! 

Following the collision of their tremendous powers, Kai was overwhelmed by an 
immense countershock force that sent him stumbling backward rapidly. 

On the other hand, Gilbert remained unmoving, watching Kai with a face filled with 
disdain. 

Kai rubbed his numb arm as the uneasiness within his chest amplified. This Gilbert is 
indeed way too formidable. There’s too huge a gap between our abilities. 

“It’s impolite if I don’t reciprocate your gesture.” After saying that, Gilbert vanished on 
the spot. 

Kai couldn’t even keep up with his overly-rapid speed. 

Bang! 



Gilbert’s fist crashed into Kai’s chest, sending the latter’s body flying backward 
instantaneously. 

A large number of scales fell off Kai’s skin as his Golem Body shattered. 

He knitted his brows and winced. 
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The opponent simply threw a punch and broke Kai’s Golem Body. It was then that Kai 
knew he was doomed. 

“What a powerful Divine Safeguard. It actually blocked off my attack…” Gilbert 
commented with amusement. 

Casting Gilbert a serious look, Kai asked, “Did Warriors Alliance send you to kill me?” 

“Zion has no right to order me around, but it’s indeed his intention for me to kill you,” 
Gilbert admitted without hesitation. 

Kai did not question further when he heard that. He knew there was no room for 
negotiation if Zion was the one who sent Gilbert. 

All they could do was fight each other until someone admitted defeat. Kai hoped the 
charm Arthur gave him would work at the most crucial moment. 

As he reached out his hand, Dragonslayer Sword appeared in his grip. 

Immediately after that, he activated the Power of Dragons, which caused Dragonslayer 
Sword to buzz loudly. 

Gilbert’s eyes instantly lit up when he saw Dragonslayer Sword in Kai’s hand. 

“A spiritual sword? You own a spiritual sword that has a sword spirit?” 

Gilbert’s breathing grew rapid. Clearly, he really liked Kai’s sword. 

“Do you still dare to fight me now that you know this is a spiritual sword?” asked Kai. 

“Hahaha! The sword spirit in your spiritual sword hasn’t taken shape yet. It’s a perfect 
time for me to steal it. Once I place my blood on it, it’ll be mine.” Gilbert laughed out 
loud. He flipped his hand around, and the tiger head sword behind him appeared in his 
hand. 



The tiger head sword glinted coldly. And as the name suggested, there was a realistic-
looking tiger carved on the blade. 

In the meantime, the tiger head sword let out roars as it was held in Gilbert’s hand. 

Seeing that, Kai immediately activated the Power of Dragons and aimed it at Gilbert 
without wasting another second. 

A terrifying sword energy that could destroy the earth was unleashed on Gilbert. 

However, Gilbert merely snorted and counterattacked with his tiger head sword. 

It let out roars as it slashed around, leaving cracks on the ground wherever it passed. 

Clang! 

As soon as both sword energy and the tiger head sword collided, a horrifying force 
spread and caused the nearby hills to tremble and break. 

This time, Kai stumbled a few steps backward from the attack, yet Gilbert was 
unmoved. However, there was a significant change in the latter’s expression; it 
gradually turned grim. “It’s truly a spiritual sword… What other valuable things do you 
have? Take them out now, or you won’t have the chance to use them anymore.” 

While saying that, Gilbert’s aura intensified, and an oppressive force rushed in Kai’s 
direction. 

“A Top Level Martial Arts Marquis, huh? Extraordinary, as expected.” 

There was a change in Kai’s countenance when he deflected the force. 

Kai could sense that Gilbert’s aura was incredible, which meant that the latter was 
already a Top Level Martial Arts Marquis for a long time. He only needed an opportunity 
to become a Greater Martial Arts Marquis. 

The thought of that made Kai’s expression turned grim. Suddenly, the draconic essence 
at his chest glowed, and a great amount of energy from the Power of Dragons flowed 
over his body. 

In the meantime, he was devising a plan in his mind to flee using the Necro Ring. 

However, using the Necro Ring required some time. He feared Gilbert would attack 
before the Teleportation Array was ready. 

“Again!” Kai yelled, and the Power of Dragons flowed to Dragonslayer Sword again. 



A golden light exploded from the weapon, followed by the appearance of a golden 
dragon that encircled the sword. 

While Kai swung his sword, a golden light spilled out, and the dragon let out a beastly 
roar before charging toward Gilbert. 

The sight of that made Gilbert frown. Not daring to waste another second, he lifted both 
his hands and infused the tiger head sword with his martial energy. 

In the next second, Gilbert let out an angry shout and swung his sword violently. 

A howling sound could be heard as the sword cut through the air. At the same time, the 
vicious tiger carved on the blade seemed to have come to life.; it roared and leaped into 
the air. 

 


